
No. FS-16/2/2024-FS-DOP
Government of lndia

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(Financial Services Division)
Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001

Dated Q2.12.2025
To

All Head of Circles / Regions

Subject: Changes in accounting of POSB TDS transactions-Reg

Madam / Sir,

This has the reference to the SB Order No. 1212025 dated 15.09.2025.

2. ln continuatlon, it has been decided that the accounting of all the TDS deductions
under section 194A, '194H, 194EE and 194N of lncome Tax Act being made from the poSB
Account Holders and the Authorized Agents (MPKBY & sAS Agents) be performed at cpRC
w.e.l. 01.12.2025. Accordingly, changes in reporting i accounting of transactions are
implemented in Finacle.

3. Changes in Accounting for the following scenarios

4. The TDS deductions at the time of counter transactions and the TDS deductions on
commission to Agents will be reversed automatically for accounting purpose, in the accounts
of the post offices and the same wall be accounted at oPRC w.e.f. 01 .12.202s adjusted through
RSAo-PosB lr rDS. Accordingly, the accounting entries will be passed automaticalty in the
DTRs of the post offrces and CPRC.

st.

No.

Scenario APT 2.0 ICSI-SAP
15.05.2025)

Daily Account (w.e.f. APT 2.0 Daily Account
(w.e.f. 01.12.2025)

1 TDS Deductions i TDS deductions under Section 194N
and TDS deductions on the periodical
interest credits under Section 194A will
be accounted at CPRC.

TDS deductions at the time of counter
transaction will be accounted at the
post office where the transaction is
initiated.

All TDS deductions will
be reported and
accounted at CPRC.

2 Agent
Commission
including TDS

All the transactions will be accounted at the
post office where the transactions are
initiated.

All TDS deductions will
be reported and
accounted at CPRC.

SB Order No. 16/ 2025



lllustration

say, an amount of t 520! is deducted towards TDS at the time of closure of a scss account
and { 400^ is deducted towards TDS for the commission paid to a MpKBy Agent in ,X, post
office. The accounting entries in DTRs will appear as follows.

(a). ln 'X' Post Office

(b) ln CPRC

Description of ltem Receipt Payment

lT TDS from lnterest Payments under 194-A 520t-

lT TDS from Commission, Brokerage under 194-H 400t-

RSAO-POSB lT TDS Payments 920r-

5. Filing of TDS returns

with the above revised approach in accounting of rDS we.f. 01 .12.202s, the TDS returns
may be filed as follows.

Description of ltem Receipt Payment

lT TDS from lnterest Payments under 194-A 520t-

Reversal of lT TDS from lnterest Payments under 194-A 520t-

lT TDS from Commission, Brokerage under 194-H 400t-

Reversal of lT TDS from Commission, Brokerage under 1g4-H 400t-

RSAO-POSB lT TDS Receipts 920t-

st.
No.

TDS ltem Returns to be
filed by

1 All POSB-TDS deductions under Section 194A, 194EE and 194N of tT
Act, accounted up to 14.05.2025

DDOs
Concerned

2 TDS deductions under Section 194A and 194EE at the time of counter
transaction and accounted at the post office where the transaction is
initaated during the period from 15.05.2025 to 30.1 1 .2025

DDOs
Concerned

3 All POSB-TDS deductions under Section 194H (TDS on Agents
Commission) accounted from 01.04.2025 to 30.11.2025

DDOs
Concerned

4 TDS deductions under Section 194N and TDS deductions on the
periodical interest credits under Section i 94A accounted at CPRC
during the period from 15.05.2025 to 30 11.2025

CPRC



5 ll POSB-TDS deductions under Section 194A, 194EE, 194H and 194N CPRC
m 01j2.2025

6. Accordingly, the burden of filing of TDS returns for TDS related to POSB operations to
the DDOs will be reduced with respect to all the CBS TDS Components. However other
matters not related to POSB viz. TDS deductions on vendor payments, payment of
commission / incentive to PLI Agents etc. may continue to be handled as per the extant
guidelines issued by, the concerned Division on the matter.

7. DDOs should ensure that-

(a). No transactions related to POSB including TDS are entered manually in accounting
module of APT 2.0 or through voucher posting in CSI-SAP F & A module.

(b) TDS returns are not filed on the basis of the Finacle TDS reports.

(c). TDS returns are flled only for the amount which is reflected in the DTR/Cash BooUoash
Account and as specified in para 5 above.

(d) lf the TDS returns were filed by the DDOs for the TDS amount accounted at CPRC,
corrections in TDS returns may be filed immediately by the DDOs concerned.

8. PostalAccounts Offices shall ensure that no amount is credited to any HO DDOs BIN

for all CBS TDS deductions lrom 01.12.2025.

9. Since the TDS deductors are mandated to issue the Form-16Ato the TDS deductees
as per the lncome Tax Rules, the Form-'l6A in respect of TDS returns filed by CPRC will be

issued by CPRC. CPRC will send the Form-16,4 to the Head Post Offices through email and

HPOs in turn will deliver the Form-16Ato the TDS deductees concerned.

10. lt is requested to circulate these instructions to all concerned viz., Post Offices,
SBCOs, ICO (SB), NCDDOs attached to CDDOS, the existing Nodal Offices in the respective

Circle, for information and necessary action.

This is issued with the approval of Competent Authority.

Yours faithfu lly

l.\
b, v

(Gou rav a in)

Assistant Director General (FS-l l)



CoDv to:

1. Sr PPS to Secretary (Posts)

2. PS to Director General PostalServices.

3. PPS/ PS to Addl DG (co-ordination)/Member (Banking)/lilember (o) i Member (P) /

Member (Planning & HRD) / Member (PLl) i Member (Tech) /AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi

5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate

6. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vigilance & CVO) / Sr' Deputy Dkector General (PAF)

7. Directot RAKNPA / GM, CEPT / Directors of all PTCS'

I Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi

9. Secretary, Postalservices Board/All Deputy Directors General

10. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors PostalAccounts

'11. The Under Secretary, liloF (DEA), NS-ll Section' North Block, New Delhi'

12 The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building,4 Deendayal

Upadhyay Marg New Delhr-110002

'13. All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations

'14 Oeputy Director (OL)for inlormation and translation oftheorderin Hindi language'

15 Guard File \n

(Go v Jain)

Assistant Director General (FS-ll)









Annexure-I 
 

STANDARD OPERATING PROCEDURE 
 

(To rectify account balance discrepancies in Post Office Savings Bank (POSB) 
accounts (POSA/SSA/PPF) arising from non-migrated transactions pertaining to the 

pre-CBS migration period) 
  
1.   Procedure 
  
1.1 Scope: This procedure outlines the steps to rectify account balance discrepancies 
in POSB accounts viz. Post-Office Savings Account (POSA), Sukanya Samriddhi 
Account (SSA) and Public Provident Fund (PPF) arising due to: 

a. non-migrated transactions from legacy application (Sanchay Post) to Finacle 
CBS; and  

b. the request received from the customer to continue to operate the account.  
   
1.2. Handling of Account: Such cases shall be handled only at the post office where 
the account existed during the pre-migration period, as the records would be available 
at that Post Office only. 
  
1.2.1.   All such accounts, in which balances differ, shall be processed with the 
approval of Gazetted Postmaster viz., Chief Postmaster, Senior Postmaster, Deputy 
Chief Postmaster, Deputy Director / Assistant Director of GPO/HO concerned for the 
cases related to GPO/HO; and Divisional Head in case of Sub Offices and Non-
Gazetted HO. 
  
1.2.2.   Procedure in Sub Post Offices: On receipt of such cases, the Sub Post Office 
shall forward the same to its Head Post Office concerned for necessary verification 
and calculation of amount of Principal and Interest, to be done through SBCO. The 
Head Postmaster shall subsequently submit such cases to the Divisional Head for 
necessary approval. 
  
1.2.3.   To ensure accurate account balance rectification, Divisional Head or Gazetted 
Postmaster, as the case may be, shall issue a precise order, specifying clearly the 
exact principal and interest amounts to be adjusted in the account, after due 
verification of the genuineness of the transactions. 
  
1.2.4.   Subsequently, the Divisional Head / Gazetted Postmaster, as applicable, shall 
process the case for approval for relaxing the parameter for posting the non-migrated 
transaction(s) for the concerned account and send it to the Circle Office.  The Circle 
office shall forward it to the Central Processing and Reconciliation Centre (CPRC) 
Chennai, with  specific recommendations of Head of the Circle as prescribed 



in  Directorate Lr. No. CBS-25/82/2022-FS-DOP dated 28.03.2024. (Copy attached for 
reference as Annexure-II).  
  
1.2.5.   On receipt of the proposal, Director CPRC Chennai, after examination, shall 
convey the approval for relaxing the parameter for posting the non-migrated 
transaction(s) to CEPT, with a copy to the Head of the Circle concerned.  
 
1.2.6.     After receipt of such approval in the concerned HO, the account shall be 
transferred to the concerned HO, if the account stands in an office other than 
the HO, and no transfer fees shall be collected as the transfer is on administrative 
ground. 
 
1.2.7.   The concerned HO shall subsequently intimate the user-IDs through which the 
transactions are proposed to be performed, to the CBS-EOD Team, through the 
Central Processing Centre (CPC) concerned. These identified user-IDs shall be 
provided with relevant Role-ID/ Work-Class, to create transaction using the office 
accounts by EOD Team. 
 
1.2.8.   On completion of above activity, the CEPT(CBS) team shall relax the 
parameter for posting of the non-migrated transaction(s) for the concerned account, 
on notified date with prior intimation to all concerned through office email.  
 
1.3      Transaction Posting:  
 
1.3.1     The designated PA and Supervisor of HO, who are authorized to perform 
such transaction(s), shall note down the First Transaction Date [General Ledger 
Date] of the account concerned in Finacle. [First Transaction Date, which is the 
earliest value date allowed for an account after migration of account in Finacle, can 
be checked in HACLI menu].  
 
1.3.2     Thereafter, following action shall be taken by the HO for posting of   the 
principal amount: 
 
I.  For PO Savings Accounts (POSA) 
 
The designated PA shall post the transaction(s) in POSA using CXFER menu, for the 
difference in Principal amount with value date as 01/04/YYYY, where YYYY is the 
financial year following the year of Migration of account in Finacle. (For example, 
if an account is migrated on 10.05.2020, the transaction shall be posted with the value 
date 01.04.2021) The Office Account SOLID+MXSBP is to be used for Credit / Debit 
leg. The Supervisor, authorized for this activity, shall verify the transaction as per the 
extant procedure. 
  
 



II.  For PPF and SSA Accounts: 
 

a.  The designated PA shall check whether the PPF or SSA account is active or a 
discontinued account. In case the account is found to be discontinued,  the 
customer should be asked to make the account active by paying the 
subscription amount for current year as well as defaulted subscriptions along 
with default fee. 
 

b.   The designated PA shall post the transaction(s) in the PPF or SSA account 
using CPDTM or CPWTM (With report code REVRS (Reversal Transaction)) 
as the case may be, for the difference in Principal amount with value date as 
01/04/YYYY, where YYYY is the financial year following the year of 
Migration. (For example, if an account is migrated on 20.12.2021, the 
transaction shall be posted with the value date 01.04.2022)  The Office Account 
viz. SOLID+MXPPP for PPF account or SOLID+MXSSP for SSA account is to 
be used for Credit/Debit leg. The Supervisor, authorized for the activity, shall 
verify the transaction as per the extant procedure. 

  
1.3.3. SBCO shall calculate and post the Interest difference through HIARM menu, for 
the period up to 31-03-YYYY,  where YYYY is the financial year of migration. SBCO 
shall update the said HIARM entries in Interest Adjustment Register maintained by it. 
  
1.3.4.   CBS-EOD Team shall monitor and co-ordinate with the CBS-CPC and HO 
concerned for successful completion of posting of the transactions. On completion of 
transaction, the parameter relaxation will be disabled by CEPT Team immediately.  
 
1.4    Post-Transaction Activities:  
 
1.4.1. Subsequently, CBS-CPC of the concerned Circle shall execute HACINT with 
end-date & value date as 31-03(31st March) of previous financial year. For 
example, if the current financial year is 2024-25, then the end-date/value date should 
be 31-03-2024.  
 
1.4.2.   CBS-CPC of the concerned Circle shall share the report from HPR menu with 
SBCO as well as HO concerned. This report shows the interest calculation which 
happened prior to the balance restoration transaction and the recalculation entries.  
 
1.4.3.   The designated official in the SBCO, shall cross-check the calculation and 
amount of interest posted in the concerned account. the designated official in SBCO 
can also generate interest report for the account in HAINTRPT menu and use the 
detailed report for verifying the interest calculations. If any discrepancy is found 
(excess or short interest),  a HIARM entry must be created accordingly for the 
difference in amount, with applicable date as 31-03 (31st March) of previous financial 
year.  



1.4.4.   While making any adjustment as explained in Point 1.4.3, HIARM entry should 
be created only for adjusting the difference in interest amount payable. After 
adjustment of interest, the said HIARM entries shall be updated in the Interest 
Adjustment Register maintained by SBCO.  
 
1.4.5.   After completion of HIARM entry by HO, the CBS-CPC of the concerned Circle 
shall execute the HACINT with end-date & value date as 01-04(1st April)  of current 
financial year 
 
1.4.6.   Timeline for Post-Transaction Activities: The post-transaction activities 
prescribed in the paragraphs above shall be completed on the day of posting or within 
the next two working days after the date of posting of such non-migrated 
transaction(s). 
 
1.4.7.   On completion of all the above activities, HO shall transfer the account to its 
original office from where it was transferred (if applicable).  
 
2. All such transactions which have been posted in connection with the updating 
of balance due to non-migration of transactions, shall be entered in a register in the 
following format by the HO  
 

Register of BACK-VALUE DATED TRANSACTIONS 
  

S
l. N

o
. 

  D
a

te of R
e

ce
ipt o

f the
 case

 
  N

a
m

e
 o

f th
e

 P
ost O

ffice
 w

he
re 

a
ccou

n
t sta

n
d

s 

S
ch

em
e

 

A
cco

un
t N

u
m

b
er (N

e
w

 /O
ld

) 
  N

a
m

e
 o

f th
e

 D
ep

osito
r(s) 

A
m

o
un

t o
f D

e
p

o
sit a

d
ju

ste
d in

 ₹
 

  A
m

o
un

t o
f W

ithd
raw

a
l a

d
justed

 in
 ₹ 

  Inte
re

st A
m

o
u

n
t A

dju
ste

d
 th

rou
gh 

H
IA

R
M

 in
 ₹

 

O
rde

r d
e

ta
il - fo

r p
o

sting
 B

a
ck V

a
lu

e
 

d
a

ted
 T

ra
n

sa
ctio

ns(in
clud

in
g

 
n

o
n

-m
igrate

d
 tran

sactio
n

s) 

D
a

te 
o

f 
p

o
sting

 
th

e
 T

ra
n

sactio
n

 
/ 

V
alu

e D
a

te
 o

f T
ra

n
sa

ctio
n

 
 Initials o

f the
 D

e
sign

a
te

d
 P

A
 

  Initials o
f the

 A
P

M
/D

P
M

 
  Initials o

f the
 In

-C
h

a
rg

e 
S

B
C

O
 

 

(1) (2) (3) (4) (5) (6) (7) (8) (9) (10) (11) (12) (13) (14) 

                            
   

  
3. The concerned Head Postmaster shall generate "Back Value Dated 
Transactions Report" available in Finacle MIS Server fortnightly and check the report 
to ensure that only the approved transactions are carried out. 



 4.       Role of Inspecting / Visiting Officers 
  
4.1      All the officers during visits should check the Back Value Dated Transactions 
Report available in HO and satisfy themselves that the Post Office has followed the 
above prescribed procedure for settling the balance difference cases if any, due to 
non-migration of transaction(s) to Finacle CBS. During visits / inspections, it should be 
also checked that the cases have been settled within stipulated time. 
  
4.2      During the annual inspection, the Inspecting Officers should check at-least 
four cases, and report observations in the Inspection Report. 
  
5.   Timelines for completion of the activity: 
  

  
* Such case shall be settled within 45 working days from the date of receipt of 
request/complaint. 
 
 
 

Stages / Activities* Activity to be completed Within 
  

Forwarding by SO to HO from the date of 
receipt of case 
  

 3 Working Days 

Activities by HO (Verification of Balance, 
Calculation of Difference of amount in 
Principal and Interest, Forwarding the 
proposal to Division Office) 
  

5 Working Days 

Division office to approve,  issue order for 
balance rectification  and forward  the 
proposal to RO/CO 
  

5 Working Days. If inquiry is 
required, then within 15 working 
days 

Recommendation & forwarding by  
 Regional Office 
 Circle Office 

  
   
5 Working Days 
5 Working Days 

Approval for Parameter Relaxation by 
CPRC, Chennai 
  

7 Working Days 

Completion of activity jointly by CBS-
CEPT/Circle CBS-CPC/HO 
  

4 working days 



 6.       Illustrations for posting the non-migrated transaction 
 

Illustration-1 
  

Assume that a deposit transaction dated 07.11.2015 amounting to ₹ 10,000/- in SSA 

account No. 1234567890 standing at Lal Bazar SO account with Srinagar GPO in 

Jammu & Kashmir Circle had not been migrated to Finacle. The parameter has been 

relaxed on 05.11.2024 for posting the non-migrated transaction. 

  

Actions required: 

 

(i).     Transfer the account No. 1234567890 to Srinagar GPO.  Authorized HO 

users shall note down the First Transaction Date (General Ledger Date) - 

04.02.2016. 

 

  (ii).      Post the transaction using the CPDTM Menu. 

 

Transaction 

Date 

Value 

Date 

Amount Debit Credit 

05.11.2024 01.04.2016 10,000/- SOLID+MXSSP i.e. 

19000100MXSSP 

Depositor’s SSA 

Account No. 

1234567890 

  

(iii).     An HIARM entry shall be made for the interest difference payable up to 

31.03.2016. 

(iv).    CPC shall execute the HACINT menu and share the report from HPR to 

HO/SBCO. 

(v).     SBCO shall check the interest posted in the account and if there is any 

difference between the interest credited in the account and the due interest 

(which needs to be calculated manually based on the actual transactions in the 

account) to be credited in the account, SBCO shall adjust the same through 

HIARM.  

(vi).     CPC shall execute the HACINT menu. 

(vii).    Transfer the account back to Lal Bazar SO. 



 
Illustration-2 

  
Assume that a withdrawal transaction dated 07.11.2013 amounting to ₹ 5,000/- in PO 

Savings account No. 2345678901 standing at Magadh University SO account with 

Gaya HO in Bihar Circle had not been migrated to Finacle. The parameter has been 

relaxed on 05.11.2024 for posting the transaction. 

  

Actions required:  

  

(i).      Transfer the account No. 2345678901 to Gaya HO and authorized HO users to 

note down the First Transaction Date (General Ledger Date) – 23.11.2015 

(ii).      Post the transaction using the CXFER Menu. 

Transaction 

Date 

Value Date Amount Debit Credit 

05.11.2024 01.04.2016 5,000/- Depositor’s POSA 

Account No. 

2345678901 

SOLID+MXSBP i.e. 

82300100MXSBP 

  

(iii).     An HIARM entry shall be made for the interest difference payable up to 

31.03.2016. 

(iv).     CPC shall execute the HACINT menu and share the report from HPR to 

HO/SBCO. 

(v).     SBCO shall check the interest posted in the account and if there is any 

difference between the interest credited in the account and the due interest (which 

needs to be calculated manually based on the actual transactions in the account) to 

be credited in the account, SBCO shall adjust the same through HIARM.  

(vi).     CPC shall execute the HACINT menu. 

(vii).     Transfer the account back to Magadh University SO. 

 

 

  

********** 



F. No I l3-03/2024
Govemment of India

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(Financial Services Division)
Dak Bhawan, New Delhi I 10001

Dated: 30.09.2025
To

All Head of Circles/Regions

Subject: Revision of interest rates for Small Savings Schemcs w.e.f.01.10.2025

Madam / Sir.

The undersigned is directed to intimate that, vide memorandum No. l/4/2019-NS dated

30.09.2025 (copy enclosed). Government of India, Ministry of Finance, Department of
Economic Affairs (Budget Division) has inlbrmed that the rates of interest on various Small
Savings Schemes (National Savings Schemes) for the third quarter of financial year 2025-26
(starting from l'r October, 2025 and ending on 3l't December, 2025) shall remain

unchanged tiom those notified for the second quarter ( ls' July. 2025 to 30th September, 2075) of
F Y 2025-26.

2. lt is requested to circulate it to all concemed for information and necessary guidance.

This may also be placed on the notice board ofall Post Offices in public area.

3. This issues with the approval ofthe Competent Authority.

umar)
t Director (SB-l)

Copv to: -

l. Sr. PPS to Secretalv (Posts)

2. PS to l)ircctor General Postal Services

l. PI'Si PS to Member (Financial Serv ices )'Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member (HRD)/
\'letrbcr ( lech)/ Member lService QLralitl and Marketing). Member (lnfrastructure). AS

&FA
4. Addl. [)irector General. APS. Neq Delhi

5. Chief General Manager. BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.

6. C (lM. CEP'I fbr kind information tnd necessary action.

7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) ,'Sr. Deputy Director General (PAI)
8. Direckrr. ITAKNPA ,/Directors of all Pl-Cs

9. Director (ienelal P &'l (Audit). Cir il Lines. New Delhi

I 0. Secletalr. Postal Servioes lloard / All Deputv Directors General

I l. All (icneral Managers (Finance ) / l)irectors Postal Accounts / DDAP

12. I-he Joint Director & HOD. Natir-rnal Savings Institute, tCCW Building. 4 Deendayal

[- padhr ar l\4arg. Neu Delhi-11000]
li. The t)nder Secretarv. MOI] (DEA). NS- Section, North Block, New Delhi.

1.1. All recosnizcd Fedcrations ,/ []nions ' Associations

15. GLrard lrilcle-lrile. Ll
umar)

t Director (SB-l)

SB Order No. l4 / 2025









2.  PERSONAL DETAILS: 

* Indicates mandatory fields. Please fill the form in English and BLOCK letters 

3.  PENSION DETAILS 

 
 

To The Postmaster,   BO/SO/HO,   SO/HO 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

I hereby request that an APY account be opened in my name under National Pension System (NPS) as per the particulars given below: 
 

 

1.  POST OFFICE DETAILS: 

POSB A/c Number*                                

Post Office Name* PINCODE* 
 

Name of Applicant in full* Shri Smt. Kumari 

Full Name* 

Date of Birth* 

Email ID 

d d / m m / y y y y Age Mobile No 

Aadhaar* 

Married Yes No If married, spouse name is mandatory. Spouse will be the default nominee under APY. 

Name of Spouse 

Nominee’s Name* 

Nominee’s relationship with the subscriber 

Additional Details in case nominee is a Minor 

Date of Birth* 

Guardian’s Name* 

Whether beneficiary of other statutory social security schemes Yes No 

Whether Income Tax Payer Yes No 

Is FATCA/CRS* applicable $ Yes No 

$ FATCA/CRS is applicable for US Persons/Tax Residents other than India. FATCA/CRS Declaration Form needs to be submitted if you are an US person or your Country of 
Birth / Country of Citizenship / Country of Residence for Tax Purpose is a country other than India. 

 

 

Frequency of Contribution (Please tick(√)) * Monthly Quarterly Half Yearly 

Pension Amount (Please tick(√)) * 1000 
 

2000 
 3000  4000  5000   

Contribution Amount 
(in Rs.) 

(To be filled by the Post Office) 

 I hereby authorize the Post Office to debit my above-mentioned account till the age of 60 for making 
payment under APY as applicable based on my age and the Pension Amount selected by me. If the 
transaction is delayed or not effected at all for insufficient balance, I would not hold the Post Office 
responsible. I also undertake to deposit the additional amount together with overdue interest thereon. 

Declaration & Authorization by all subscribers 
I meet the prescribed eligibility criteria for assistance under APY and I have read and understood the terms and conditions of the Scheme. I hereby agree to the same and 
declare that the information furnished by me is true and correct, to the best of my knowledge and belief. I undertake to immediately inform the Post Office of any change in the 
above information furnished by me. Further, I do not hold any pre-existing account under APY. I understand that I shall be fully liable for submission of any false or incorrect 
information or documents. I have read/been explained and have understood the APY guidelines. I further agree to be bound by the terms and conditions of provision of 
services under the scheme as approved by PFRDA/Govt. of India. 
I hereby authorize PFRDA to use my Aadhaar details for APY and authenticate my identity through the Aadhaar Authentication system in accordance with the provisions of the 
Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and other subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 and rules and regulations notified thereunder. I have been given to understand that 
my information submitted to PFRDA herewith shall not be used for any other purpose other than mentioned above, or as per requirement of law. 

 

 

Date 

Place 

 
Signature/Thumb Impression* of Subscriber 

(* LTI in case of male and RTI in case of female) 

 
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT - SUBSCRIBER REGISTRATION FOR ATAL PENSION YOJANA (APY) 

(To be filled by the Post Office) 

Name of the Subscriber: 

PRAN Number 

Guaranteed Pension Amount Periodicity of Contribution 

Contribution Amount under APY (in Rs.) 
 

Name of the Post Office:   
 
 

 
          Signature of the Postmaster with office stamp 

BO/SO/HO  

Receiving Officer’s Name:  

Date of Receipt of Application:  

*Atal Pension Yojana has now been included under the Section 7 of the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act 2016. As per the 
provisions of the act, any individual who is eligible to receive benefits under the scheme will have to furnish proof of possession of Aadhaar number or undergo enrolment under 
Aadhaar authentication. All new APY registrations will have to comply with the above directives. 

(Administered by Pension Fund Regulatory and Development Authority) 

 

 

 Aadhaar             

 Aadhaar             

  

d d / m m / y y y y  

 

d d / m m / y y y y 
 



Self-Certification for Individual - FATCA/CRS Declaration Form 

 
Name of Subscriber: 

 
Permanent Retirement Account Number (PRAN): 

Date of Birth: 

 

FATCA/CRS Declaration Form 

Part I- Please fill in the country for each of the following: 

1 Country of: 

a) Birth  

b) Citizenship  

c) Residence for Tax Purposes  

2 US Person (Yes / No)  

Part II- Please note: 

a. If in all fields above, the country mentioned by you is India and if you do not have US 
person status, please proceed to Part III for signature. 

 
b. if for any of the above field, the country mentioned by you is not India and/or if your US 

person status is Yes, please provide the Tax Payer Identification Number (TIN) or 
functional equivalent as issued in the specific country in the table below: 

i) TIN  

Country of Issue  

ii) TIN  

Country of Issue  

iii) TIN  

Country of Issue  

 

a. In case any of the parameters in Part I indicates that you are a US person or a person 
resident outside of India for tax purpose and you do not have Taxpayer Identification 
Numbers/functional equivalent, please complete and sign the Self-Certification section 
given in Part IV. 



b. In case you are declaring US person status as ‘No’ but your Country of Birth is US, please 
provide document evidencing Relinquishment of Citizenship. If not available provide 
reasons for not having relinquishment certificate 

 
 

Please also fill Part IV Self-Certification. 

Part III- Customer Declaration (Applicable for all customers) 

(i) Under penalty of perjury, I/we certify that: 
1. The applicant is (i) an applicant taxable as a US person under the laws of the United 

States of America (“U.S.”) or any state or political subdivision thereof or therein, 
including the District of Columbia or any other states of the U.S., (ii) an estate the 
income of which is subject to U.S. federal income tax regardless of the source 
thereof. (This clause is applicable only if the account holder is identified as a US 
person) 

2. The applicant is an applicant taxable as a tax resident under the laws of country 
outside India. (This clause is applicable only if the account holder Is a tax 
resident outside of India) 

 
(ii) I/We understand that the NPS Trust is relying on this information for the purpose of 

determining the status of the applicant named above in compliance with FATCA/CRS. 
The NPS Trust is not able to offer any tax advice on CRS or FATCA or its impact on 
the applicant. I/we shall seek advice from professional tax advisor for any tax questions. 

(iii)  I/We agree to submit a new form within 30 days if any information or certification on 
this form becomes incorrect. 

(iv) I/We agree that as may be required by domestic regulators/tax authorities the NPS Trust 
may also be required to report, reportable details to CBDT or close or suspend my 
account. 

(v) I/We certify that I/we provide the information on this form and to the best of my/our 
knowledge and belief the certification is true, correct, and complete including the 
taxpayer identification number of the applicant. 

(vi) I/We permit/authorise NPS Trust to collect, store, communicate and process information 
relating to the Account and all transactions therein, by NPS Trust and any of its affiliates 
wherever situated including sharing, transfer and disclosure between them and to the 
authorities in and/or outside India of any confidential information for compliance with 
any law or regulation whether domestic or foreign. 

(vii) I / We hereby accept and acknowledge that NPS Trust shall have the right and authority 
to carry out investigations from the information available in public domain for 
confirming the information provided by me / us to NPS Trust. 

(viii) I/We shall indemnify NPS Trust for any loss that may arise to NPS Trust on account of 
providing incorrect or incomplete information. 

Signature : 
 

Name :  

Date (DD/MM/YYYY) :  

 



 
 
 

To be filled only if- 
 
(a) Name of the country in Part I is other than India and TIN or functional equivalent is not 

available, or 

(b) US person is mentioned as Yes in Part I, and TIN is not available 

I confirm that I am neither a US person nor a 
resident for Tax purpose in any country 
other than India, though one or more 
parameters suggest my relation with the 
country outside India. Therefore, I am 
providing the following document as proof 
of my citizenship and residency in India. 

 
 
 
 
 

 
Signature 

Document Proof submitted (Pls tick document being submitted) 

Passport Election Id Card PAN Card 

Driving License UIDAI Letter NREGA Job Card 

Govt. Issued ID Card 

 

Part IV- Self-Certification: 



No. FS-1 6/2/2024-FS-DOP
Government of lndia

I\/inistry of Communications
Department of Posts

(FS Division)
Dak Bhawan' New Delhi110001

Date: 15.09.2025

To

All Head of Circles / Regions

s b ct cha ng S n accou ntins of PoSB tra NSacti nS- Rcg
u J

Sir/Madam,

2. CBS Accounting in SAP through GL Files lntegration:

a.ReferenceisinvitedtotheSBorderNo.og/2ol9daled13.12.2019videwhichaStandard
Operating Procedure for the CBS and CSI GLs integration was circulated'

b Through CBS-CSI GL lntegration' all the transactions are accounted based on ACCOUN1

SoLi.e.allthetransactionsareaccountedatthepostofficeswherethePoSBaccounts
stand. (For exam pte, if a deposit in a Savings Account standing at Chennai GPO is made

at New Delhi GPQ, the deposit amount ias accounted at Chennai GPO') Further' the

transactigns happening in the channels other than the bounter were also accounted at the

post offices where the 
""ao,ntt 

stand (For example' if one SCSS account is opened

through lnternet Banking by a customer whose saving account stands at Ahmedabad GPO'

ir," i-CSs deposit and POSA withdrawal are accounted at Ahmedabad GPO')

AlltheCBstransactionsincludingthoseperformedthroughchannelsviz.,ATM,e-Banking,
M-Banking, Sweep-ln, Sweep-O-ut, Standing lnstructions etc ' were accounted based on

Account S=OL ,tt"t DC Closure, through GL flles lntegration'

This approach led to certain challenges in inclusion of all channel and lnter-SoL

transactions in the "Daily Transaction RJport" of Post Offices even though the transactions

arenotdoneinthosepostomcesFurther,the..DallyTransactionReport,,couldnotbe
generated by the Post Offices on the same day of the transaction' due to GL integration

c

d

after DC Closure.

3. Changes made in the Operational activities and CBS Accounting:

w.e.f. 15.05.2025, the accounting process of POSB transactions has been changed as

follows.

SB Order No. 1212025

ThisiSregardingchangesintheAccountingofCBsTransactionsinAPT(Advanced
Postal Technology) Solution ln this connection' the accounting approach in SAP' changes made

in Finacle, the revised accounting approach in APT are mentioned below' for information and

necessary action. The gummary Jf the changes are also mentioned, for ready reference.



To overcome the challenges in the existing processes, and to eliminate the reconciliation issues,
an exclusive "Centralized processing and Reconciliation Centre (CPRC)" is established at
Chennai and few changes are also.made in Accounting as follows:

(i) All the transactions are accounted based on TRANSACIoN sol. Accordingly, the posB
transactions are accounted in the post offices where the transactions are done. i.e. if a deposit is
made in New Delhi GPo for savings Account standing at chennai Gpo, the deposit amount is
accounted at New Delhi GpO.

(ii) All the transactions like Standing lnstructions and transactions performed in channels other
than counters are accounted at centralized processing & Reconciliation centre (cpRC),
Chennai.

Thus, the following POSB transactions are accounted at CpRC, Chennai:

a. lnternet Binking & Mobile Banking Transactions

b. IPPB - PosB Transactions (sweep Transactions, RD, ssA & ppF Transactions)

c. ATM transactions including ATM charges, sMS charges etc., and related GST collections.

d. lnward credits through NEFT & RTGS and outward Debits through NEFT & RTGS (other
than at Post Ofiices)

e. Standing lnstructions Transactions (MlS / TD / SCSS / PM CARES accounts interest credits
to POSA / Bank Accounts and credits in RD from pOSA)

f. Cheque Clearing Transactions (Grid)

g NACH Transactions (DBT & ECS)

h. APY / PMJJBY / pMSBy auto debit transaction

i. Transactions between pLl & POSB (Credits and Debits)

j. TDS deductions under Section 1 94N and ,l94 A of lncome Tax Act

k. lnterest Corrections (HIARM entries)

l. Annual lnterest Credits

m. Annual Account Maintenance Charges

(iii) The transactions generated in CBS due to transfer of accounts from one post office to
another post office or due to sol merger / closure will be reflected in FINACLE and not be
reflected in the DTR of post ofiices or the CPRC.

(iv). Accrual lnterest Accounting in Finacle, for Cash Certificates ls discontinued from
01.04.2025.

(v) MSSC interest credited quarterly in the accounts will be accounted only at the time of closure
of accounts.

(vi). On operationalization of new ATMs, the cash balance available in ATMs across the country
will be considered as the balance in CPRC.



(vii). ln APT 2.0, CBS transactions data of the post offices is fetched through API (Application

Programming lnterface). CBS data of Branch post offices (BO) will be available in DTR of

resiective e6, once the End of Day ofthe BO is triggered by lnternal Mobile Application (lMA) in

CBb. Departmental PostOffices (PO) data can be fetched inAPT2'0 once the SOL completes

the execution of HISCOD and CSMDAY menus'

(viii) A lhe CBS-CPCS should ensure that lhe HSCOD menu is executed after the day end

intsCOotcSuoeY is peiormed at SOL (Po) tevel' An sOP (enclosed) is alreadv circulated

vide email dated 0'1.08.2025.

(ix) once the CBS-data is fetched successfully' the BOs and Oepa(mental Pos can view the

ceS O"t in tt 
" 

Dtn on the same day and verify the transactions with the POSB vouchers All

the post offices should tally the PosB Receipts and Payments without fail on day-to- day basis

and ensure that the data is correctly reflected in the DTR'

(x). Salary / Pension / Vendor Payments processed by the ODOS for credit to PoSB Accounts

srlattoeaccountedattherespectiveHos,salary/VendorPaymentsprocessedbythenon-
crreque drawing DDOS (NCDDO) attached to the Cheque drawing DDOs (CDDO) for credit into

POSB Accounti are accounted in the respective CDDO SOL Hence' these transactions are also

tobetakenintoaccountoftherespectivecDoo'TofacilitateverificationbythecDDos,
concerned NCDDOS shall ensure to send the list of POSB Accounts along with the Amounts

processed by them to their respective CDDO.

(xi). CBS data for CPRC will be available post-Oc closure in a file format which will not impact

the Post Office Accounting. CPRC Accounts data will be consumed in APT 2'0 and accordingly'

the DTR of CPRQ can be viewed on the next day'

(xii). The following reports are available in Finacle for tallying the CBS transactions with the data

fetched in DTR of Post Offices.

. Production server

1 GL IT2.O Transaction Report - Consolidated (Same Day)

2 GL lT2.O lransaction Report - Detailed (Same Day)

3. GL lT2.O Report GL Wise - Consolidated (Same Day)

. Mls Server

1 GL lT2.O Transaction Report - Consolidated (Previous Day)

2. GL lT2 O Transaction Report - Detailed (Previous Day)

3 GL lI2 o Report GL Wise - Consolidated (Previous Day)

4. Generation of Daily Cash Book and lvlonthly Cash Account:

a. APT Solution is developed to generate the DTR by each Post Offlce'

b The system of generation of BO Summary, So Daily Account' So Summary' Ho Cash Book

s provided in the APT Solution.



c Each Post Office should ensure the correctness of CBS Data Accounting with reference to
the transactions done at their Office oo a daily basis, without giving room for reconcaliations at
later stage.

d. ln case of any djscrepancy in CBS data in the DTR of Post Offices, ticket may be raised in
Support Desk, for rectification.

5. Check by SBCO at Head Post Offices: The CBS data accounted in the Daily Cash Book at
HO shall be verified by the SBCO with reference to the Transactions done at the post Offices
under the HO jurisdiction to ensure 100 o/o accuracy in the accounted figure, for which a detaited
SOP will be provided in due course. ln the meantime, the reports available in Finacle and that
accounted in HO Daily Cash Book, may be vermed.

6. Summary of Changes in Accounting for the following scenarios-

S.No. Scenario GL Daily Account (Post CBS
CSI GL

PT 2.0 Daily Account (w.e.f
15.0s.2025)

lntegration)

1 Counter
Iransactrons

nccount SOL Accounting

[ransactions performed acros
all channels in the account

nsaclion SOL Accounting

the counter
sactions irespective of the

linked to that SOL are reflected in

GL daily account.
nt SOL, will be reflected in

e daily account (DTR) of the
post

where transactions are
rformed

Automatic Entry
(rvfls/scss/TD/Pt
CARES to SB)

Withdrawals and Deposits transactions will be in the daily
reflected in the SOL where th
account stands adjusted by

nt of CPRC

Respective Sub Account
(RSAO)

3 NACH

GPO
Chennai SB Deposil wrll reflect in account

SOL and cash debrts (NACH) wrll
nll transactrons will be in the daily
account of CPRC

be reflected in Chennai GP
adjusted by RSAO.

4 Standing lnstruction
(SB to RD)

SB Wthdrawal and RD DepositlAll transactions will be
are accounled in SOL wherelincorporated rn the darly accounl
these accounts stand adjustedlof CPRC
by RSAo 

I

2



5 B Withdrawal in SOL whe transactions will

ccount and incorporated in the daily accou

PY/PMJJBYi PMSBY credits i Of CPRC

nsad Marg adjusted by RSAO

lnternet . Banking

Mobile Banking

I transactions are reflected transactions will

he SOL where the SB accounts incorporated in the daily acco

of cPRc
tand and adjusted by RSAO

r SOLS

6

7 IPPB _ POSB CBS ll transactions are reflected ll transactions will be

SOL where the acco ncorporated in the dailY accoun
ransactions and adjusted by RSAO CPRC

dal SOL, only one leg

d adjusted by RSAO

8 lil (POSB Withdrawals are reflected in ISB Withdrawals will be in the

nde SOL where the accoun daily account of CPRC a
ransactions

OSB ATMs)
ends and ATI\.4 cash accoun justed wlth ATM Cash

bit in theAT[/ SOL adjusted b

9 ATM (POSB

Transactions in

Other banksATirs)

SB Withdrawals are reflected in

the SOL where the account

stands and NFS account debit in

Bengaluru GPO adjusted bY

RSAO

I transactions will

incorporated in the daily accou

of cPRc

10 ATM (Other bank

card Transactions in

POSB ATIVs)

ffiM-Eash account Debit in ATM

SOL and NFS credit in

Bengaluru GPO adjusted bY

RSAO

transactions will be in the dail

unt of CPRC and adju

ith ATM

ash

11 TDA / SBA

accounts maturity

credits in other SOL

SB accounts

DA debits and SB aredi

ctions are accounted

concerned where

nts stand and adiusted
L

RSAO

the debits and credits wi b

nted in the SOL where th

ransactions are initiated

12 RICI / DARPAN

Transactions

ln BO concerned ln BO concerned

13 Non RICT / DARPAN

Transactions

ln account offlce as

office transactions

account n Account Office

unt
ransactions

14 lnterest Booking ln account SOL All transactrons w be n

stands



ntries daily account of CPRC

15 lnterest Application
Entries

ln account SOL Itransactions will be in the da
unt o, CPRC

16 SOL I\i]ERGER Debits in old SOL and Credits in
new sol

ot required to be Accounted

17 Scheme Transfer Both the credits and debits ol
same scheme in same SOL

Not required to be Accountea

18 GL Transfer Debits in old SOL and Credits in
new soL

Not required to be Accounted

1 I HRI,S (Salary
Pension / Claims)

B Deposit in account SOL a
larylPension/Claim

account debit in SOLS con
nd adjusted by RSAo

ll transactions will be in the
aily account of SOL where
alary / Pension

Clarm offrce account ex sts

20 AIM Cash Loading

/ Unloading

Accounted in the ATM SOL
concerned

nted in the ATM SO
ncerned

1 DS Deductions ccounted in the SOL where th
ount from which TDS deducted

i)TDS deduction under Sectl
'194N and TDS deductions
he periodical interest credits
nder Section 194A will be
ccounted at CPRC.

(ii) TDS deductions at the tim
counter transaction will be

post office where
ransaction is initiated

Lrnted at the

22 Agent Commission
including TDS

unted in the SOL where th
nt commission credit accoun

stands

ll the transactions will be
ccounted at the post office

here the transactions are
nitiated

lPLt - PosB cBS

Transactions

All sB Debits and credits
accounted at the SOLwhere the SB
account stands and adjusted by
credits & debits in office account at
Bengaluru GPO through RSAO

are I transactions will be in the
daily account of CPRC

23



4 KVP/NSC Maturi
lnterest

aturity lnterest are accounted a KVP/NSC payments

he SOL where the KVP/NS including interest will

account stands on the date unted at the transaction

aturity irrespective of PaYment t initiatinE SOL on the date

payment.he certificate holders

is has been stoPPed w.e f
1.04.2025

7. Henceforth the Nodal Office activities for POSB Operations carried out by Bengaluru GPO'

PAO Delhi, Sansad Marg HO stands discontinued in a phased manner till the entire activities are

managed by CPRC, Chennai shortlY.

8. lt is requested to circulate these instructions to all concerned viz., Post offices, sBCOs, ICO

(sB), NCDDOs attached to cDDOs, the existing Nodal offices in the respective circle, for

information and necessary action.

This issues with the approval of Competent Authority

G rav Jatn

Assistant Director General (FS-l l)

Copv to: -

1. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)

2. PS to Director General Postal Services.

3.PPS/PStoAddl.DG(Co-ordination)/Member(Banking)/Member(o)/Member(P)/
Member (Planning & HRD) / Member (PLl) / Member (Tech) /AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi

5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate

6. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vigilance & CVO) / Sr' Deputy Director General (PAF)

7. Director, RAKNPA/ GM, CEPT / Directors of all PTCs'

8. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New pelhi

L Secretary, Postal Services Board/All Deputy Directors General

10. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors PostalAccounts

11. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block' New Delhi'

12. The Joint Director & HOD, National savings lnstitute, lccw Building, 4 Deendayal

Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-1"10002.

13. All recognized Federations / Unions /Associations

\t \D



14. Deputy Director (OL) for information and translation ofthe order in Hindi language.

15. Guard File
f *,.., .,1
916Y

(6ourav Jarn)
Assistant Director General (FS-ll)



SB Order No. 1'll 2025
No FS-1 0/5212021 -FS-DOP

Government of lndia
Ministry of Communications

Department ol Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001
Dated: 10.09.2025

To

All Head of Circles/Regions

Subject: Change ol terminology used tor specilic category ol account
holders, viz. "Persons with unsound mind" in POSB Schemes.

lVaoam ,' Sir.

The matter related to usage of appropriate terminology, for specific category
ot persons with unsound mind often referred to as individuals with mental health
conditions or intelleclual disabilities, requiring a guardian to manage lheir financial
accounts under the Post Olfice Saving Schemes and require special consideraiion
within the legal framework, was under examination ol this Department in
consultation with Ministry of Social Justice & Empowerment, Department of
Empowerment of Persons with Disabilities (Divyangjan), Ministry of Health and
Family Welfare etc.

2. Alter delailed examination, It has been decided to use a common
terminology as "Persons with mental illness or intellectual disability" in place
ol'persons with unsound mind' in POSB Schemes, to address such categories of
depositors mentioned above.

2. Henceforth. it is requested to use"Persons with mental illness or
intellectual disability" in all lorms and stationery and also in software, in place of
"persons with unsound mind, henceforth. Necessary amendments will be made in
Rules & Regulations in due course.

3. lt is reiterated that this order intends to change only the nomenclature. All
other conditions for opening & operating POSB schemes will remain the same.

4. lt is requested to circulate these instructions to all concerned for information
and necessary guidance. This may also be placed on the notice board of all Post
Olfices in the public area.

5. This issues with the approval ol lhe Competent Authorily.

. Alit Kumar)
SSIS tant Director (SB-l)

1. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services
3. PPS/ PS to Member (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member

(HRD)/ Member (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and Marketing), Member
(lnfrastructure), AS & FA

Copy to: -



4. Addl. Drrector General, APS, New Delhi
5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.
6. CGM, CEPT for kind information and necessary action.
7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Director General (PAF)
8. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs
9. Director General P & T (Audit). Civil Lines, New Delhi

10. Secretary. Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General
11. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
12. The Joint Director & HOD, Nalional Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building, 4

Deendayal Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-110002
13. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
14. All recognized Federations / Unions i Associations
15. Guard Fileie-File.

Kumar)
istant Director (SB-l)



SB Order No.10/2025

F S -'l 3 17 I 2020 -FS-Pa rt ( 1 )

Government of lndia
Ministry of Communications

Department of Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 1 't 0001
Dated: 15.07.2025

To

All Head of Circles/Regions

Subject: Freezing of Small Savings Schemes accounts matured but not closed
after 3 years.

Sir/Madam,

Please refer to SB Order No.2512022 dated 16-12-2022, concerning the freezing of
Small Savings Schemes accounts, under INOP-freeze Code, that have matured but not
closed even after three years of maturity.

2. As per the aforementioned SB Order, it was decided to freeze matured accounts under
the schemes MlS, SCSS, TD, KVP, NSC, RD, and PPF accounts (that are matured but not
extended), which have not been closed even after three years since maturity. The designated
freeze reason code for these accounts is 'INOP: lnoperative more than 3 years'.

3. To further enhance security of hard-earned money of depositors, it has now been
decided that this freezing activity will be conducted twice a year as a continuous cycle. The
process of identification and freezing of such accounts will be completed within 15 days,
commencing from 1't July and '1't January of each year. This means accounts that complete
three years of maturity as on 30th June and 31st December every year, respectively, will
be identified and frozen

4. The Standard Operating Procedure (SOP) for handling these frozen accounts, as
detailed in SB Order 2512022, remains in effect and must continue to be followed.

5. This issues with the approval of the Competent Authority.

Yours faithfully,

\5 7-0

(Deve nd mar Sharma)
Assistant Director (SB-l l)



Copv to: -

'1 . Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services
3. PPS/ PS to Member (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member

(HRD)/ Member (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and Marketing), lvlember
(lnfrastructu re), AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi

5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate i Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.
6. CGM, CEPT for kind information and necessary action.
7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr Deputy Director General (PAF)

8. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs
9. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi
10.Secretary, Postal Services Board /All Deputy Directors General
1 1 . All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
12.The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building, 4 Deendayal

Upadhyay lvlarg, New Delhi-'1 10002
13.The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
14.All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations
15. Guard File/e-File.

\>(
(Devender mar Sharma)u

Assistant Director (SB-l l)

?



SB Order No. 09 / 2025
F. No l13-0312024

Government of India
Ministry of Comnrunications

Department of Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001

Dated: 30.06.2025
To

All Head of Circles/Regions

Subject: Revision of interest rates for Small Savings Schemes w.e.f. 01.07.2025

Madam / Sir,

The undersigned is directed to intimate that, vide memorandum No. 11412019-NS dated

30.06.2025 (copy enclosed), Government of India, Ministry of Finance, Department of
Economic Affairs (Budget Division) has informed that the rates of interest on various Small
Savings Schemes (National Savings Schemes) for the second quarter of financial year 2025-26
(starting from l't July, 2025 and ending on 30th September,2025) shall remain unchanged

frorn those notified for the first quarter (1't April, 2025 to 30ftJune, 2025) of FY 2025-26.

2. It is requested to circulate it to all concerned for information and necessary guidance. This
may also be placed on the notice board of all Post Oflices in public area.

3. This issues with the approval of the Competent Authority

Director (SB-l)
Cop_y to:

1. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)

2. PS to Director General Postal Services

3. PPS/ PS to Member (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member (HRD)/
Member (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and Marketing), Member (Infrastructure), AS

&FA
4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi

5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate lParcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.

6. CGM, CEPT for kind information and necessary action.

7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Director General (PAF)

8. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs

9. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi

10. Secretary, Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General

I l. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP

12. The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings Institute, ICCW Building, 4 Deendayal

Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-l10002
13. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-II Section, North Block, New Delhi.

14. All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations

15. Guard File/e-File.

)

)umar
Director (SB-l)

tt1



F.No.1l4l?S1g-N$
Government of lndia
Ministry of Flnance

fepartment of EcCInCImic Affair.s
(Budget Division)

$ubjemt: Revision of intEr*st rates firr $mal{ $avings $chemes - rcg.

?. This has approval of the competent authority.

1, The Finance Secretary & Secretary (EA),
Department of Hconomic Affairs,
N*rth filCIck, l"lew Delhi.

s. Tn* Senretary.
Llmpnrlment of Financial Services,
J*mv;un Oe*p Sui{ding, New *elhi.

9. Chief $ecretaries of States I UT
Govemment

2, The Secretary,
Depafiment of Posts,
Sak Bhawan, New Delhi.

New Delhi.

S" The Secretary,

10^ The Joint Director
National Savings lnstitute,
New Delhi.

North Btock, New Delhi
Dated: 3S"S8.?025

SFFISH MUMSHANUUM

The rat*s of interest on varirus $n"rall $avings Schem*x for the s*cond quarter of
$:Y ESX$-P$ utxt-ting fronr '!erJuly, l0l.$ und ending un 3CIth $eptember, 2025 shall remsin
unchanged from those notified for the fir$t quarter (lutApril, 2025 to 30th June, 2025) of
rY rn3$-2s"

{Masroor Ahmad)
fieputy Secretary (Budg*t)

Tele * 011 23095SSS

3" The $ecretffry,
ffi mBartrn ent uf f; xpenditure,
tJnrth Slonk, New Deltri"

The thief Seneral Manager {DGSA)
Resmrv* Bank of lndia,
S**tral Sffic* ftIumbai"

8. Re,serve Bank of India
Central Account $e*tion,
Additional Office Building,
Hast High Court Road, Civil Lines,
F"H. No.15, Nagpur * 440 0CI1.



SB Order No. 08/ 2025

No. GBS-25/2/2025-FS-DOP
Government ol India

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(F.S. Division)

[)ak Bhawan, New Delhi I 1000 I

Date:07.05.2025
,Ib

All Head of Circles / Regions

Subject: Introduction of facility to dorvnload Interest Certificate fronr lX)l'
I nternet Bankin -Re rtl in

Madam / Sir,

A Standard Operating Procedure for issue of Interest Certificate to thc ['osl]
Depositors by generating the Interest Certificate frorn Finacle CBS at Post Of'fice levcl
rvas issued vide SB Order No. 3812021 dated 23.11 .2021 .

2. For the convenience of the Internet Banking customers, provisions have been

rnade for E-Banking users for downloading the lnterest Certificate through Intcrnet

Banking portal and the patch for the same has been deployed on 30.04.2025.

3. Henceforth, DOP Intemet Banking customers can download the Interest
Certificate for the Previous Financial Year and Current Financial Year from the Internet

Banking portal, without visiting the post office.

4. For this purpose, Internet Banking user, after login in the portal, can download
the Interest Certificate on clicking the Interest Certificate option provided under

Accounts Tab.

LU

)



5. It is requested to circulate these instructions to all the post offices for inlormation
and guidance. Adequate prornotion of this functionality is to be given for the beneflt ol
PoSB customers. The circles should also make an effort to propagate intemet banking
usage amongst its customers.

This is issued with the approval of Competent Authority.

Yours taith lLlli

Io
\:l

a

(Go a\ .l u

Assistant Director General (FS-JI )
Copt'to:-

1. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services.
3. PPS/ PS to Addl. DG (co-ordination)/1\4ember (Banking)/Member (o)/Member. (r)1,

Member (Planning & HRD)/Member (pll)iMember (Tech)lAS & FA
4. Addl. Director General. APS. New Delhi
5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / parcel Directorate / pLI Directorate
6. Sr. Deputy Director Generar (Vigilance& cvo) / sr. Deputy Direcror General (pAF)
7. Director. RAKNPA / GM. CEPT / Directors of all pTCs.
l]. l)ireclor General P & 1'(Audit), Civil Lines. New Delhi
9. Secretary, Postal Services Board/ All Deputy Directors General
10. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors postal Accounts / DDAp
l1.The Under Secretary. MOI-- (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
12. The Joint Director & HoD. National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building. 4 Deendal,al

Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi- I 10002.
13. All recognized Federations ' Unions / Associations
14.Deputy Director (oL) fbr information and translation of the order in Hindi larrguage.
15. Guard File

A a

ra\ lll
Assistant Director General ( [rS-ll )

(Go it



No-F5-25-01 /201 8-FS-CBS
Government of India

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(F.S Division)
Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - I 10001

Date:30.04.2025
ADDENDUM

To
All Head of Circles / Regions

Subject: Extension of e.KYC functionality for opening of MIS, TD, K\? and
NSC scheme accounts - Regarding.

***
Madam / Sir,

This has the reference to the SB Order No 0l dated 0l 0l.2025

2. Aadhaar based e-kyc process has been introduced pan India in all departmental

post offices w.e.f . 06.01.2025 for onboarding of new customers (Creation of Customer

Information File (CIF)) and opening of Single & Individual Type Post Office Savings

Accounts (POSA).

3. In continuation, Aadhaar enabled eKYC process has been enabled for opening

of Monthly Income Account Scheme (MIS), Time Deposit Scheme (TD), Kisan Vikas

Patra Scheme (K\?) and National Savings Certificate VIII Issue (NSC) scheme

accounts w.e.f 23 .04.2025.

4. Accordingly, now the post offrces will be able to open the MIS, TD, KVP and

NSC scheme accounts of Single - Individual (Adult) type through Aadhaar

authentication using e-KYC CIF.

5. On invoking the CMISAOP menu, the Counter PA has to obtain the biometric of
the depositor for getting the consent to use his/her Aadhaar and proceed for feeding the

other details for opening ol the account. On completion ol all the data entry in
CMISAOP screen, before submission, second biometric of the depositor shall be

obtained for authenticating the transaction.
Lt

i?

*on{iy lnco6. s.h.h. r i.6 D.por( r.ounl op..ri!

lo{r., 
***---l

X !:oo.ra,rlr,*.r*
ir.r.o.r..rr. Fnflu

I :,r.*ror.l',-o.tour,o,r^a-durltlr'116.drr&lrt

-i[.,!c"_]-i*sql

SB Order No.07/2025

S.rrrrt sller{r roe rrl.rr.



I

I
iTrdrr(d.-ah

6. No-pay-in-slip (deposit) voucher shall be collected for any amount of deposit
while opening these accounts on Aadhaar Authentication basis. The amount written by
the depositor in the Account Opening Form (SB-eKYC-AOF) shall be considered as
amount of deposit.

7. lf the depositor desires to transfer the funds from PO Savings Account for
opening of MIS/TDiKVPA.,ISC accounts, the debit account should be either Single or
Joint B type account olthe depositor. In case the account is opened on transfer offunds
from the PO Savings Account of the depositor, withdrawal form (SB-7) shall not be
collected, as the account is opened thnough biometric authentication of the depositor.

8. The existing process shall be lollowed for the paper-based (voucher based)
transactions.

9. Aadhaar Authenticated Transactions will directly be posted in the ledgers and
require no verification by the checker. Accordingly, the account will be opened directly
on biometric authentication ofthe depositor.

10. All the transactions including the POSA debit transactions, posted for opening
of MIS/TD,4(VP,A{SC through bio.metric authentication shall appear in the ..EKyC
long book detailed report".

I l. The development of functionalities like Account Closure, Transfer of Accounts,
change of nomination (Account Modification) etc. through biometric authentication are
underway. Meanwhile, these operations shall continue to be performed through the
existing method.

12. The following points are once again rerterated.

(D For any eKYC based transactions, AOF or any other lorm collected from
the customer shall have Aadhar no. in masked lorm (xxxx-xxxx-_). If any
document contains the unmasked Aadhaar, Postmaster should ensure that first eight
digits of the Aadhaar number are masked using black ink pen or sketch or any availa-ble
means.



(iD. All the post offices and CBS-CPCs should ensure that the Aadhaar
Number is masked in all the existing documents like AOF, KYC Form etc.
containing the Aadhaar Number including the copy ofthe Aadhaar obtained.

(iiD. Circles should ensure that paperless KYC due diligence is performed for
all the new customers and existing account holders for ease oIKYC compliance and

other benefits to the customers and Department.

13. It is requested to circulate these instructions to all post offrces for information
and guidance.

Yo

(Gou Jai

a

ur$ fait
/-\
[.

htut

n

Assistant Director General (FS-II)
Copf lq-

1. Sr PPS to Secretary (Posts)

2. PS to Director General Postal Services.

3. PPS/ PS to Addl. DG (Co-ordinaion)/Member (Banking)/Member (O),A,Iember (P/
Member (Planning & HRD)/Member (PLI),Member (Tech)/AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi
5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI D ectorate

6. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vigilance & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Director General (PAF)

7. Director, RAKNPA / GM, CEPT / Directors of all PTCs.

8. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi

9. Secretary, Postal Services Board/ All Deputy Directors General

10. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
11. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-II SectiorL Nordr Block, New Delhi.

12.The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings Institute, ICCW Building, 4 Deendayal

Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi- 110002.

13. All recognized Federations / Unions / Associalions
14. Depury Director (OL) for information and translation of the order in Hindi language.

15. Guard File

/'.r
t-l 'J>

(Go vJ in)a

Assistant Director General (FS-ll)

This issues with the approval of Competent Authority.

lv/



SB Order No. 06/2025
FS-101',U2022-FS-DOP

Government of lndia
Ministry of Communications

Department of Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001

DaIed: 04.04.2025
To

All Heads of Circle/Region

.e.f. 01 A ril, 2025 - R

Madam / Sir,

This is with reference to amendments made vide Finance Act, 2025, published
on the 29th March 2025.

2. ln accordance with the Finance Act,2025, provisions related to TDS deduction
under various sections of lncome Tax Act 1961 have been amended as under:

2.1 "ln section 194A of the lncome-tax Acf, rn sub-section (3),- (a) in clause (i),-

ll.

lll.

for the words "forty thousand rupees", wherever they occur, the words "fifty
thousand rupees" shall be substituted;
in sub-clause (d), for the words "five thousand rupees", the words "ten
thousand rupees" shall be substituted;
in the third proviso,-

(A) for the words "forty thousand rupees", the words "fifty thousand rupees"
shall be substituted;
(B) for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the words "one lakh rupees" shall
be substituted;

2.2. "ln section 80CCA of the lncomelax Ac[ in sub-section (2), after the first
proviso, the following proviso shall be insefted and shall be deemed to have been
insefted with effect from the 29th August, 2024, namely:- "Provided fufther that the
amount referred to in clause (a) which is withdrawn on or after the 29th August, 2024,

shall not be charged to tax in the case of an assessee, being an individual".

2.3 "ln section 194H of the lncomelax Act, in the first proviso, for the words "fifteen

thousand rupees", the words "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted"

rSubject: Amendments related to Tax Deduction at Source (TDS) deductions
under various sections of lncome Tax Act 1961 notified in the Finance Act 2025



3. lt is requested to circulate it to all concerned for information and necessary
guidance. This may also be placed on the notice board of all Post Offices in public

area.

4. This issues \ /ith the approval of the Competent Authority

Encl. As above.

(Deven mar Sharma)
Assistant Director (SB-ll)

Copy to: -

r. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services
3. PPS/ PS to lMember (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)i Member

(HRD)i Memcer (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and Marketing), Member
(lnfrastructure), AS & FA

4. Addl. Directol General, APS, New Delhi

s. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.
6. CGM, CEPT'or kind information and necessary action.
7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Director General (PAF)
8. Director, RAX.NPA / Directors of all PTCs
e. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi
10. Secretary, Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General
rr. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
12. The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building, 4

Deendayal Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-1 1 0002
13. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
14. All recognizecl Federations / Unions / Associations
ls. Guard File/e-File.

.{\}-r
harma)(Devend uma

Assistant Director (SB-l l)

"{



REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—25jftLVªh lañ Mhñ ,yñ—¼,u½04@0007@2003—25

xxxGIDHxxx
xxxGIDExxx

vlk/kkj.k
EXTRAORDINARY

Hkkx  II — [k.M 1
PART II — Section 1

izkf/kdkj ls izdkf'kr
PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

lañ   7]	 ubZ fnYyh] 'kfuokj] ekpZ 29] 2025@pS= 8] 1947 ¼'kd½	
No. 7] 	 NEW DELHI, SATURDAY, MARCH 29, 2025/CHAITRA 8, 1947 (Saka) 

bl Hkkx esa fHkUu i`"B la[;k nh tkrh gS ftlls fd ;g vyx ladyu ds :i esa j[kk tk ldsA
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 29th March, 2025/Chaitra 8, 1947 (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the 
29th March, 2025 and is hereby published for general information:—

THE FINANCE ACT, 2025
No. 7 of 2025

[29th March, 2025.]
An Act to give effect to the financial proposals of the Central Government 

for the financial year 2025-2026.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of India 
as follows:–– 

CHAPTER I 

PRELIMINARY 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Finance Act, 2025.

(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Act,––

(a) sections 2 to 91, 104 to 120, 125 and 136 shall come into force on the
1st day of April, 2025; 

(b) sections 121 to 124 and sections 126 to 134 shall come into force on
such date as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official 
Gazette, appoint. 

Short title and 
commencement. 

सी.जी.-डी.एल.-अ.-29032025-262125
CG-DL-E-29032025-262125



Sec. 1] 	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY	 7

(i) fifty lakh rupees but does not exceed one crore rupees, the total
amount payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon shall not 
exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total income of fifty lakh 
rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds fifty lakh rupees;  

(ii) one crore rupees but does not exceed two crore rupees, the total amount
payable as income-tax on such income and surcharge thereon shall not exceed 
the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on a total income of one 
crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees;  

(iii) two crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax on such
income and surcharge thereon shall not exceed the total amount payable as 
income-tax and surcharge on a total income of two crore rupees by more than 
the amount of income that exceeds two crore rupees: 

Provided also that in case of every co-operative society resident in India, 
whose income is chargeable to tax under section 115BAD or section 115BAE of the 
Income-tax Act, the income-tax computed under this sub-section shall be increased 
by a surcharge, for the purposes of the Union, calculated at the rate of ten per cent. 
of such income-tax: 

Provided also that in the case of a specified fund, referred to in clause (c) of 
the Explanation to clause (4D) of section 10 of the Income-tax Act, whose income 
includes any income under clause (a) of sub-section (1) of section 115AD of the 
Income-tax Act, the income-tax computed on that part of income shall not be 
increased by any surcharge. 

(4) In cases in which tax has to be charged and paid under sub-section (2A) of
section 92CE or section 115QA or section 115TD of the Income-tax Act, the tax 
shall be charged and paid at the rates as specified in those sections and shall be 
increased by a surcharge, for the purposes of the Union, calculated at the rate of 
twelve per cent. of such tax. 

(5) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 193, 194A, 194B,
194BA, 194BB, 194D, 194LBA, 194LBB, 194LBC and 195 of the Income-tax Act, 
at the rates in force, the deductions shall be made at the rates specified in Part II of 
the First Schedule and shall be increased by a surcharge, for the purposes of the 
Union, calculated in cases wherever prescribed, in the manner provided therein. 

(6) In cases in which tax has to be deducted under sections 192A, 194, 194C,
194DA, 194E, 194EE, 194G, 194H, 194-I, 194-IA, 194-IB, 194-IC, 194J, 194LA, 
194LB, 194LBA, 194LBB, 194LBC, 194LC, 194LD, 194K, 194M, 194N, 194-O, 
194Q, 194R, 194S, 194T, 196A, 196B, 196C and 196D of the Income-tax Act, the 
deductions shall be made at the rates specified in those sections and shall be 
increased by a surcharge, for the purposes of the Union,— 

(a) in the case of every individual or Hindu undivided family or
association of persons, except in case of an association of persons consisting 
of only companies as its members, or body of individuals, whether 
incorporated or not, or every artificial juridical person referred to in 
sub-clause (vii) of clause (31) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, being a 
non-resident except in case of deduction on income by way of dividend under 
section 196D of the Income-tax Act, calculated,— 

(i) at the rate of ten per cent. of such tax, where the income or the
aggregate of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the 
deduction exceeds fifty lakh rupees but does not exceed one crore rupees; 

(ii) at the rate of fifteen per cent. of such tax, where the income or
the aggregate of such incomes paid or likely to be paid and subject to the 
deduction exceeds one crore rupees but does not exceed two crore 
rupees; 



22 	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY	 [Part II— 

Amendment of 
section 72AA. 

Amendment of 
section 80CCA. 

Amendment of 
section 80CCD. 

15. In section 72AA of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st April, 2026,––
(i) the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:––

“Provided that where any scheme of such amalgamation is brought 
into force on or after the 1st April, 2025, any loss forming part of the 
accumulated loss of the predecessor entity, being–– 

(a) the banking company or companies; or
(b) the amalgamating corresponding new bank or banks; or
(c) the amalgamating Government company or companies,

as the case may be, which is deemed to be the loss of the successor entity, 
being–– 

(i) the banking institution or company; or
(ii) the amalgamated corresponding new bank or banks; or
(iii) the amalgamated Government company or companies,

as the case may be, shall be carried forward in the hands of the successor 
entity for not more than eight assessment years immediately succeeding 
the assessment year for which such loss was first computed for original 
predecessor entity.”; 
(ii) in the Explanation, after clause (vii), the following clause shall be

inserted, namely:–– 
‘(viii) “original predecessor entity” means predecessor entity in 

respect of the first amalgamation.’. 
16. In section 80CCA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), after the first

proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been 
inserted with effect from the 29th August, 2024, namely:–– 

“Provided further that the amount referred to in clause (a) which is 
withdrawn on or after the 29th August, 2024, shall not be charged to tax in the 
case of an assessee, being an individual.”.  
17. In section 80CCD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st April, 2026,––

(a) in sub-section (1B), after the proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:–– 

“Provided further that the deduction under this sub-section shall 
also be allowed, where any payment or deposit is made to the account of 
a minor under the pension scheme referred to in the said sub-section, by 
the assessee, being the parent or guardian of such minor, subject to the 
condition that the aggregate amount of deduction under this sub-section 
shall not exceed fifty thousand rupees.”; 
(b) in sub-section (3),––

(i) in the opening portion, for the words “in his account”, the words
“or a minor, in his account or the account of a minor, as the case may 
be,” shall be substituted; 

(ii) after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:–– 

“Provided further that the amount received by a person, being
the parent or guardian or nominee of a minor, on account of closure of 
the pension scheme referred to in sub-section (1B) due to the death of 
the minor, shall not be deemed to be the income of such person.”; 

(c) in sub-section (4), in the opening portion, after the words “Where any
amount paid or deposited by the assessee”, the words “in his account or the 
account of a minor” shall be inserted. 



Sec. 1] 	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY	 33

54. In section 158BFA of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of
September, 2024,–– 

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “total income including undisclosed
income”, the words “undisclosed income” shall be substituted and shall be 
deemed to have been substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (4), for clause (ii), the following clause shall be
substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted, namely:–– 

“(ii) the period commencing on the date on which stay on the 
proceeding under sub-section (2) was granted by an order or injunction of 
any court and ending on the date on which certified copy of the order 
vacating the stay was received by the jurisdictional Principal 
Commissioner or Commissioner:”. 

55. Section 158BI of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted and shall be deemed
to have been omitted with effect from the 1st day of September, 2024. 

56. In section 193 of the Income-tax Act,––
(a) after the words “whichever is earlier,”, the words “being the amount

or the aggregate of amounts exceeding ten thousand rupees during the 
financial year,” shall be inserted; 
(b) in the proviso, in clause (v), in sub-clause (a), for the words “five thousand

rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
57. In section 194 of the Income-tax Act, in the first proviso, in clause (b), for

the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be 
substituted. 

58. In section 194A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (3),––
(a) in clause (i),––

(i) for the words “forty thousand rupees”, wherever they occur, the
words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-clause (d), for the words “five thousand rupees”, the
words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted; 

(iii) in the third proviso,––
(A) for the words “forty thousand rupees”, the words “fifty

thousand rupees” shall be substituted; 
(B) for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one

lakh rupees” shall be substituted; 
(b) in the proviso occurring after clause (xi), in clause (b),––

(i) for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh
rupees” shall be substituted; 

(ii) for the words “forty thousand rupees”, the words “fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

59. In section 194B of the Income-tax Act,––
(a) for the words “or the aggregate of amounts”, the words “in respect

of a single transaction” shall be substituted; 
(b) the words “during the financial year” shall be omitted.

60. In section 194BB of the Income-tax Act,––
(a) for the words “or aggregate of amounts”, the words “in respect of a

single transaction” shall be substituted; 
(b) the words “during the financial year” shall be omitted.

Amendment of 
section 158BFA. 

Omission of 
section 158BI. 

Amendment of 
section 193. 

Amendment of 
section 194. 

Amendment of 
section 194A. 

Amendment of 
section 194B. 

Amendment of 
section 194BB. 



34 	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY	 [Part II— 

Amendment of 
section 194D. 

Amendment of 
section 194G. 

Amendment of 
section 194H. 

Amendment of 
section 194-I. 

Amendment of 
section 194J. 

Amendment of 
section 194K. 

Amendment of 
section 194LA. 

Amendment of 
section 194LBC. 

Amendment of 
section 194Q. 

Amendment of 
section 194S. 

Omission of 
section 206AB. 
Amendment of 
section 206C. 

61. In section 194D of the Income-tax Act, in the second proviso, for the words
“fifteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

62. In section 194G of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
“fifteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

63. In section 194H of the Income-tax Act, in the first proviso, for the words
“fifteen thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

64. In section 194-I of the Income-tax Act, for the first proviso, the following
proviso shall be substituted, namely:–– 

“Provided that no deduction shall be made under this section, where   
the income by way of rent credited or paid for a month or part of a month 
by such person to the account of, or to, the payee, does not exceed fifty 
thousand rupees:”. 
65. In section 194J of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in the first

proviso, in clause (B), for the words “thirty thousand rupees” wherever they occur, 
the words “fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted. 

66. In section 194K of the Income-tax Act, in the proviso, in clause (i), for
the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be 
substituted.

67. In section 194LA of the Income-tax Act, in the first proviso, for the words
“two lakh and fifty thousand rupees”, the words “five lakh rupees” shall be 
substituted. 

68. In section 194LBC of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the
portion beginning with the words “at the rate of” and ending with the words “payee 
is any other person”, the words “at the rate of ten per cent.” shall be substituted. 

69. In section 194Q of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (5), in clause (b),
the words, brackets, figures and letters “other than a transaction to which 
sub-section (1H) of section 206C applies” shall be omitted. 

70. In section 194S of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), for the words,
figures and letters “sections 203A and 206AB”, the word, figures and letter 
“section 203A” shall be substituted. 

71. Section 206AB of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted.

72. In section 206C of the Income-tax Act,––
(a) in sub-section (1),—

(i) in the Table,—
(A) against serial number (iii),—

(I) in column (2), for the word “Timber”, the words and
brackets “Timber or any other forest produce (not being 
tendu leaves)” shall be substituted; 

(II) in column (3), for the words “two and one-half
per cent.”, the words “two per cent.” shall be substituted; 
(B) against serial number (iv), in column (3), for the words

“two and one-half per cent.”, the words “two per cent.” shall 
be substituted; 

(C) serial number (v) and the entries relating thereto shall be
omitted; 
(ii) after the proviso, the following Explanation shall be inserted,

namely:— 



56 	 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY	 [Part II— 

(ii) in the case of every company other than a domestic company,––

(a) having a total income exceeding one crore rupees but not exceeding ten crore
rupees, at the rate of two per cent. of such income-tax; and 

(b) having a total income exceeding ten crore rupees, at the rate of five per cent.
of such income-tax: 

Provided that in the case of every company having a total income exceeding one crore 
rupees but not exceeding ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and 
surcharge on such income shall not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax on a total 
income of one crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds one crore rupees: 

Provided further that in the case of every company having a total income exceeding 
ten crore rupees, the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on such income shall 
not exceed the total amount payable as income-tax and surcharge on a total income of ten 
crore rupees by more than the amount of income that exceeds ten crore rupees. 

PART II 

RATES FOR DEDUCTION OF TAX AT SOURCE IN CERTAIN CASES 

In every case in which under the provisions of sections 193, 194A, 194B, 194BA, 194BB, 
194D, 194LBA, 194LBB, 194LBC and 195 of the Income-tax Act, tax is to be deducted at the 
rates in force, deduction shall be made from the income subject to the deduction at the following 
rates:–– 

Rate of income-tax 

1. In the case of a person other than a company—

(a) where the person is resident in India—

(i) on income by way of interest other than “Interest on
securities” 

10 per cent.; 

(ii) on income by way of winnings from lotteries, puzzles,
card games and other games of any sort (other than winnings 
from online games) 

30 per cent.; 

(iii) on income by way of winnings from horse races 30 per cent.; 

(iv) on income by way of net winnings from online games 30 per cent.; 

(v) on income by way of insurance commission 2 per cent.; 

(vi) on income by way of interest payable on— 10 per cent.; 

(A) any debentures or securities for money issued by or on
behalf of any local authority or a corporation established by 
a Central Act, State Act or Provincial Act; 

(B) any debentures issued by a company where such
debentures are listed on a recognised stock exchange in India 
as per the Securities Contracts (Regulation) Act, 1956      
(42 of 1956) and the rules made thereunder; 

(C) any security of the Central Government or State
Government; 

(vii) on any other income 10 per cent.; 

(b) where the person is not resident in India—

(i) in the case of a non-resident Indian—



SB Order No. 05/2025
F. No 113-03/2024

Government of lndia
Ministry of Communications

Department of Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001
Dated: 03.04.2025

To

Subject: Circulation of amendment in Government Savings Promotion General
Rules,2018.

Madam / Sir,

The undersigned is directed to forward a copy of the Gazette notification dated
02.04.2025 issued by the Department of Economic Affairs, Ministry of Finance in

connection with the amendments in rules related to Government Savings Promotion
General Rules, 2018.

2. G.S.R. 214 (E) - Government Savings Promotion General (Amendment)
Rules, 2025.

3. lt is requested to circulate it to all concerned for information, guidance and
necessary action. Same may also be placed on the notice board of all Post Offices in

public area.

4. This issues with the approval of competent authority

Encl. As above

(Devender Kumar Sharma)
Assistant Director (SB ll)

All Head of Circles/Regions

"ln the Government Savings Promotion General Rules,2018, in the Schedule ll,
under Fee to be charged for services, the words and figures "(b) Cancellation or
change of nomination - t50" shall be deleted".



Copy to: -

r. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
z. Sr. PPS to Director General Postal Services
3. PPS/ PS to Member (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member

(HRD)/ Member (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and lv'larketing), Member
(lnfrashucture), AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi
s. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.
o. Chief General Manager, CEPT for information and necessary action please.

7. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Direrctor General (PAF)
g. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs
e. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi
10. Secretary, Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General
11. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounls / DDAP
12. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
13. The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building, 4

Deendayal Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-110002
14. All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations
1s. Guard File/e-l:ile.

o3\
(Dev ende umar Sharma )

Assistant Director (SB ll)



i'. ff.qtr.- 33004/99

ird! a

Che Gozette of lnd
EIT'T

S.fr. -O.t'e. -gt. - ozo4?o?5-zGzz35
cG-DL-E-0204202 5-262235

3RITEMIT

EXTR/\ORDINARY

qrrr lI-qT g 3-gq-q!-g (i)
P,\R'l' ll Section 3-Sub-section (i)

xrF+r<trfiRr<
PUBLISIIED B\',{Li]'HORITY

to

q. l75l

No. l75l
a-tRd, gcr<, B{t{ z, zozsA{ lz, rq+z

NE\I' DELHI. \\'EDNESDA\', APRIL 2, 2OZ'ICHAI'TF.A 12,1947

G-{iTrqq
(3rFtd6r{frrrFr)

qfu{f{T

qr.+r.R. 214(q).-ulfltrfi dEtrq {fuF,{q, 1873 (1873 $r 5) ff rrra ts am q-<r qrffii +r s-+rr

+rt gq, t-*q {.6rt, rr+rt ++a deglr qrqFq fi{q, 20t B t 3f. ftiiem ;nti } ftq fr,Ffrkd d-r{r a-{rfr

t,3rqt{:-

t. {ftsil{ df<crtq - (1) En ffii q+ er6r,1a-q-aqaei{qrqrq (Tfufr?r<) ft{q,2025 6?,r qr s+{nl

(z) q-a rctrft trqrr t r+:;rcm ft ilfire t ratr 6fnr

z. t-mrfrq-fi€srlaqrqFaft{q,2018fi q-{q+ tt t, t{rcfiit{e"flftdfrq wrt<rieg"+ha-5c, trqdttqiq}
"(s) {rqi+-{ fir Frs-{ srsmr rffi 9fi-ard={-<so" r:;r ffirq ft:,qr qrqnl

FEr. {. 1 /4/2023-qilr,{(Trrr.)l

ffir< 3rtGi{rrrq, {g-fl qk{

i-z: 1-rt fim 5.r w t xra i 7r rz, ,rErr*rr?Tr, 'rrrr ll, rr= 3, s.r,ir: (i) t aftqr;n dreqr RT.{,r.fr. 1003(3r),

ft-{i:6 s 3r€fi, 2o1a l47n r-fifrr,r f}qr rr+r',n, fri a1-{ ii {rq{r qr.$r.ft. 238 (rr), fi;n,r 31 qd,2023

+ :rea {viIfu+ frrr rr+r ':irr r:q:,qr;r rrrzri qr.+:,r.ft. +ea(a), ft-+r+ s E-drg, 2023 + ilfi TieiiF}tr frqr rrfir

2314 Ct2u25 (l)

REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99



2 ]'HE CAZETTE OF INDIA : EX-IRAORDINARY IPARr ll-SEC. 3(i)

MINISTRY OF FINANCE

(Departmcnt of Economic Affairs)

NOTIFICATION

New Delhi, the 2nd April,2025

G,S.R. 214(E).-ln exercise of the powers confcrrcd by scction 15 ol'the Govemment Savings
Promotion Act, lE73 (5 of 1873), the Central Government hereby makes thc following Scheme to further
amend the Government Savings Promotion Ceneral Rules, 201 8, nanrcly:-

l. Short title and commencement. - (l) These rules may be called the Government Savings Promotion
General (Amendment) Rules, 2025.

(2) It shall come inlo tbrce on the date of its publication in the otlicial ga:zette.

2. ln the Govemment Savings Promotion General Rules,20l8. in the Schedule , under Fee to be

charged for services, the rvords and figures "(b) Cancellation or change ol'nonrination - {50" shall
be deleted.

[F. No I /4/2023-NS(PI.)]

SOLOMON AROKIARAJ, Jt. Secy.

Note : The principal rules was originally published in the Gazette of India, Exlraordinary, Part II, section 3,
subsection (i) vldc notification number G. S. R. 1003(E), dated the 5th October,20l8, subsequently
amended vide number G S.R. 238(E), dated the 3lst March, 2023 and subsequently amended vide
number G.S.R.488(E), dated the 3"r Ju|y,2023.

Uploaded by Dte. r,f Printrng at Govern,ncnt oi lmlia Prcss. Ring Road. Mayapuri. Ncw Delhi- I 10064
and Pr.rblished by the Cbntroller ol- Pub licotions, Delhi-11905.1. IT.1''"' :i5ri" 

-



SB Order No. 04 12025
F. No 113-0312024

Govemment of India
Ministry of Communications

Department of Posts
(Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001

Dated: 28.03.2025
To

All Head of Circles/Regions

Subject: Revision of interest rates tbr Small Savings Schemes w.e.f. 01.04.2025

Madam / Sir,

The undersigned is directed to intimate that, vide memorandum No. ll4l20l9-NS dated

28.03.2025 (copy enclosed), Govemment of India, Ministry of Finance, Department of
Economic Affairs (Budget Division) has informed that the rates of interest on various Small
Savings Schemes Qllational Savings Schemes) for the first quarter of financial year 2025-26
(starting from lstApril, 2025 and ending on 30th June,2025) shall remain unchanged from
those notified for the fourth quarter ( 1 st January , 2025 to 3 1 't March, 2025) of FY 2024-25 .

2. It is requested to circulate it to all concemed for information and necessary guidance

This may also be placed on the notice board of all Post Offices in public area.

3. This is issued with the approval of the Competent Authority

Ajit Kumar)
Assistant Director (SB-f )

Copy to: -

1.. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services
3, PPS/ PS to Member (Financial Services)/Member (O)/Member (P)/ Member (HRD)/

Member (Tech)/ Member (Service Quality and Marketing), Member (Infrastructure),
AS&FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi
5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorute lParcel Directorate IPLI Directorate / CEPT
6. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Director General (PAF)
7. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs
8. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi
9. Secretary, Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General
10. A1l General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
11. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-II Section, North Block, New Delhi.
12. The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings Institute, ICCW Building,4 Deendayal

Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-110002
13. All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations
14. Guard File/e-File.

Kumar)
Assistant Director (SB-I)





No FS-1 3/01/2023-FS-DOP
eTl{d +gmR/Government of lndia

$qR EiTrilq lNIinistry of Communications

S16- frfrm lOepartment of Posts

ffiq ffi'ceTra / (Financial Services Division)

Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001
Dated: 28.03.2025

To

All Heads of Circles / Regions

Subject: Mahila Samman Savings Certificate Scheme (MSSC)- Reg.

Madam / Sir,

This has reference to the SB Order 05/2023 dated 31.03.2023 issued in
connection with the Mahila Samman Savings Certificate Scheme (MSSC), 2023.

2. Department of Economic Affairs, Ministry of Finance vide letter no. 141112019-
NS-Part (1)dated 27.03.2025 has informed that, in accordance with the prevailing
guidelines and notifications concerning the Mahila Samman Savings Certificate
Scheme (MSSC), the scheme will remain effective only until 31st March 2025. After
this date, no new deposits shall be accepted under the scheme.

4. This issues with the approval of competent authority

Yours faithfully,
Encl: As above.

,1.$\e
(Devender Sharma)

p5

Assistant Director (SB-ll)

SB Order No. 03 / 2025

3. The undersigned is directed to request all the Circles to circulate it to all
concerned for information, guidance and necessary action. Same may also be placed
on the notice board of all Post Offices in public area.



Copy to:

1. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
2. PS to Director General Postal Services.
3. PPS/PS to Addl. DG (Co-ordination)/Member (Banking)/ Member (O)/

Member(P) /Member (Planning & HRD)/Member (PLl)/Member (Tech)/AS &
FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi
5. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate
6. Sr. Deputy Di.ector General (Vigilance) & CVO) / Sr. Dy. Director General

(PAF)
7. Director, RAKNPA / GM, CEPT / Directors of all PTCs
8. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi
9. Secretary, Postal Services Board/ All Deputy Directors General
10.All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP
1'1. Chief Engineer (Civil), Postal Directorate
12.All Sections of Postal Directorate
13.All recognized Federations / Unions / Associations
14. GM, CEPT fo" kind information and necessary actions.
15. Deputy Secretary, DEA, MoF, NS-ll, North Block, New Delhi - 1 '10001.

16.Joint Director & HOD, ICCW Building, 4 Deendayal Upadhyay Marg, New
Delhi

17.e-file/Guard File

(Devender umar Sharma)
Assis;tant Director (SB-l l)

v<



F. No. 14l1/2019-NS-Part(1 )

Government of lndia

Ministry of Finance

Department of Economic Affairs

(Budget Division)

North Block, New Delhi

Dated: 27.03.2025

To

The Jt. Director & HOO,

National Savings lnstitute,

ICCW Building. New Delhi-2

SuLrlerl Mahila Sanrman Savings Certificate Scheme (MSSC) - reg.

Sir,

I am directed to refer to the sublect captioned above and to inform you that, in

accordance with the prevailing guidelines and notifications conceming the Mahila

Samman Savings Certificate Scheme (MSSC), the scheme will remain effective only

until 31st March 2025. After this date, no new deposits shall be accepted under the

scheme.

2 ln light of this, it is reguested that the National Savings lnstitute (NSl) may

inform all banks. agencies, and the Department of Posts to ensure that the necessary

actions are laken

.l l43) 2? o

tDr Kartik Agrawal,

Deputy Director (Budget)

Tele - 23095016

1

Fit€ No. f5.rJlr/2021.f5-DOP (Computer No. lr?a!07)



No-CBS-25/4/2023-FS-DOP
Government of lndia

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(Financial Services Division)
Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 110001

Dated: 17.03.2025

To

All Head of Circles / Regions

Subject: lmplementation ol 40o/o Withdrawal Functionality for MSSC Scheme
in Finacle - Reg.

Madam / Sir,

2. As stipulated in Rule 7 of the MSSC Scheme, 2023, "The account holder shall
be eligible to withdraw a maximum of up to forty percent of the Eligible Balance, once,
after the completion of one year from the account opening date, and prior to the
account's maturity."

3. ln accordance with Rule 7 of the MSSC Scheme,2023, a functionality enabling
the 40% withdrawal from MSSC accounts has been deployed in Finacle, effective from
07.03.2025.

4. A Standard Operating Procedure (SOP) detailing the withdrawal process within
Finacle is attached as Annexure for reference.

5. lt is requested to circulate the SOP to all concerned for information, guidance
and necessary action.

6. This issues with the approval of the Competent Authority

Yours faithfully,
Encl: As Above

\?
(Devende umar Sh arma

I
)

)Assistant Director (SB-ll

SB Order No. 02 /2025

Kindly refer to SB Order 5/2023 dated 31 .03.2023, which circulated the rules
pertaining to the Mahila Samman Savings Certificate (MSSC) Scheme.



Copv to: -

r. Sr. PPS to Secretary (Posts)
z. PS to Director General Postal Services.
3. PPS/ PS to Addl. DG (Co-ordination)/Member (Banking)/Member (O)/Member

(P)/ Member (Planning & HRD)/Member (PLl)/Member (Tec'h)/AS & FA.
4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi.
s. Chief General Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate.
6. Sr. Deputy Director General (Vig) & CVO) / Sr. Deputy Direc;tor General (PAF).
7. Director, RAKNPA / Directors of all PTCs.
8. Director General P & T (Audit), Civil Lines, New Delhi.
9. Secretary, Postal Services Board / All Deputy Directors General.
10. All General Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP.
11. The Under Secretary, MOF (DEA), NS-ll Section, North Block, New Delhi.
12. The Joint Director & HOD, National Savings lnstitute, ICCW Building, 4

Deendayal Upadhyay Marg, New Delhi-110002.
13. All recognizeo Federations / Unions / Associations
14. ADG (OL) for information and Hindi Translation of SB Order.
ls. GM, CEPT for information and uploading this order on lndia Post Website.
16. Guard File/e-[:ile.

q
(Devenderr mar Sha

Assistant Director (SB-l l)
Kd



 SOP-40% withdrawal in MSSC account 06-03-2025 

Annexure 

 

Standard Operating Procedure for 40% withdrawal in MSSC account 

 As per Rule 7 of MSSC 2023, The account holder shall be eligible to withdraw maximum up 
to forty per cent of the Eligible Balance once after the expiry of one year from the date of opening of 
the account but before the maturity of the account. 

Withdrawal option has been provided in TDA account Closure menu HCAACTD 

Process in Finacle 

MSSC Account No. 020000295125 (Illustration) 

 

Counter PA  

 Invoke menu  HCAACTD – Function – Close  - Enter the MSSC account number 

 Once MSSC account number is entered withdraw label will get enabled. This option will get 
enabled only for MSSC account and not for other scheme accounts.  

 Closure value date in criteria page will be auto-populated as the last quarterly interest due 
date, and the field will be in disabled status. This value date need not be modified by CPA, as 
interest calculations will get done internally, according to the actual BOD date on which 
withdrawal is done. 

 Click on Yes  

 Enter the amount of withdrawal required in the Withdrawal Amt (Original Deposit Amount) 
field. Only 40% of deposit amount has to be entered in this field. Appropriate error will be 
thrown if the amount entered is more than 40% of the deposit amount.  

 Total withdrawal amount will be including Interest for the amount entered in the above 
field.  



 SOP-40% withdrawal in MSSC account 06-03-2025 

 

 Once the principal amount of withdrawal is entered, final amount of withdrawal including 
interest will be displayed. Counter PA has the option for entering /modifying the prinicpal 
amount according to the need of the customer. 

 

(For example, in an account opened with a deposit of ₹ 2 Lakh having a balance of ₹ 2,15,427/- after 
expiry of one year, if the withdrawal of 40% is sought, Counter PA has to enter the amount of ₹ 
80,000/- (40% of the Deposit amount) and the amount payable will be 40% of ₹ 2,15,427/- i.e. ₹ 
86,171/-) 

 Click on OK if the amount of withdrawal matches the amount requested by the customer.  

 System will move to Closure Details page.  

 Withdrawal amount is payable by the cash if the amount is within the prescribed limit or by 
credit in to PO savings account or through Postmaster cheque account. Credit to other bank 
account through ECS option is not available.  

 In case of credit into POSA or through cheque, Repayment account ID is to be entered by the 
Counter PA 



 SOP-40% withdrawal in MSSC account 06-03-2025 

 

 Then, In Closure exceptions - Select Closure reason code as MSWD – MSSC Withdrawal only 

 

 After entering all the required information, Click on SUBMIT from Closure Details Screen 

 ON clicking SUBMIT, total withdrawal amount breakup will be shown. 

 

Supervisor 

 Supervisor should verify the MSSC withdrawal using the menu HCAACVTD 

 

Note: Due to product functionality, Withdrawal will be treated as part closure only. 

 



No. 25-01/2018-FS-CBS
Govemment of India

Ministry of Communications
Department of Posts

(F.S. Division)
Dak Bhawan, New Delhi - 1 10001

Date: 01 .01 .2025

To
AII Head of Circles / Regions

Subject: lntroduction of paperless KYC (e-KYC) process and Post Office Savings

Bank (POSB) Account opening & Transactions through Aadhaar

Biometric Authentication - R arding.

Madam / Sir,

As a maior initiative, it has been decided by competent authority to introduce paperless

KyC process and POSB account opening and transactions through Aadhaar Authentication

basis (e-KyC). The e-KYC based account opening is proposed to be implemented in phased

manner. Accordingly, it has been decided that onboarding of new customers (Creation of
Customer Informiti,on File (CIF)) and opening of Single & Individual Type Post Ollce
Savings Account (POSA) in Departmental Post Offices through Aadhaar based e-KYC

pro..* ur. done in Phase - I and necessary changes have been made in Finacle-cBS.

2. The following new Finacle menus are introduced'

S.No

2

S.No

Changes in the following menus have been made.

eMenu
Creation of CIF through Aadhaar Authentication (e-KYC CIF

creation) and changing the existing CIF to e-KYC CIF through

rocess

ECCRC

Modification of CIF through Aadhaar Authentication (e-K

CIF modification

YCECMRC

Chan e in briefMenu
Provision for opening of Single Individual (Adu

Aadhaar authentication usin
It) type

POSA throu e-KYC CIF
CASBAO

Provision for Modification in e-KYC based POSA throug

Aadhaar Authentication

h2 CAST]AM

Option lor Transaction in POSA t
Authentication and through Pay-in-Slip or

hrough Aadhaar
Withdrawal Fornt

Pa er-based

CTM
CXFER

3

4

System will show the masked Aadhaar number and re

number for the e-KYC CIFs

ferenceCICD5

114

SB Order No. 01/ 2025

Re-KYC

1

I



3' cIF of the customers who are_willing to provide the consent for Aadhaar e-Kyc shalbe created on Aadhaar Biometric Authentr"i'tion u^rl, such case the forlowing details willbe fetched from centrar Identities Data Reposit".y iCiozu ofUnique Iden,in."ii""rarrn".iryof India (UIDAD.

Name of the Customer
C/o Name (Father / Ilusband,s Narre)
Date of Birth
Gender
Address with pin code

The above fetched data cannot be edited. Howeve r, if c/o Name (Father / Husband.sName).is not received, option is available to edit the same. Ifany other data is not fetched orfetched partially in case of any' of the 
"u*o-"r, .r.t customer,s cIF will not be created as e_KYC cIF and the customel should be requested to update the Aadhaar with correctinformation for performing Aadhaar uuth"nir"ut"J transactions in the poSB Accounts.otherwise, such customers_ cIF may b. ...ui"J folrowing ,r," .,.,rrirJ p".cess. Anvmodification in the e-Kyc crF shall te onry on Aadhaar Authenticarion o.rt, 

"rJ 
.; J'Jilwithout the presence of the customer, no modification in e-Kyc cIF is allowed. Aadhaarauthenticated cIF related modifications require no u..iti.ution by the checker in Finacre.

4. Deposits and withdrawals (credits and Debits) from the poSA linked with e_KycclF shall be allowed either .n Aadhaar Authentication basis or paper-basis (voucher basis).when any deposit is made by person other than J.p"ri,"r, it wiil be processed on paper-basis(pay-in-slip shalr be colected). The existing p.o."r, ,t utt be follor.ved for all the paper-based(voucher based) transactions.

5. Changes related to other pOSB schemes and im
vet to be maie in Finacle. r,r suchchanges ... -"0.,'f ir"iil;:::Lf;;,"f,",;.ffiHfi?
the customers in physical fonn for Aadhia. 

"-Kyc;l;ng with the specimen signature of thedepositors and upload the signature in Finacle. er.tt-, account opening form with minimuminformation shall also o" "orrrrt'!" up^p.or.a rpl.iiens of the consent form and AccounrOpening Form (SB-eKyC- 1 & SB -eKY^C'-AOF, ;;; ;""hed herewith

6' No voucher (pay-in-slip) shall be collected for any deposit transaction irrespective oftransaction amount and for the withdrawal transactions amounting to { 5.000/_ or less. rvhentransaction is performed on Aadhaar Autt 
"nticutlo, 

Ua.is.

7 ' Aadhaar Authenticated rransactions u,ill directry be posted in the Finacle ledgers andrequire no verification by the checker. ----"J

8 A separate report of ail the Aadhaar Authenticated rransactions ,,EKyc Long BookDetailed Report,' shall be available i, tf,. n.p*t, ff4"ru (HFINRPT).

9. A detailed Standard Operating procedure (SOp) is attached herewith.

214



10. ln Phase - I, only Single Type POSA inctuding Basic Savings Account can be

opened on Aadhaar Authentication basis. For opening ofall other types ofPOSA and other

schemes accounts, e-KYC CIF may be created and accounts shall be opened in Finacle as per

the existing process. Besides, all other operations like Account Closure, Transfer ofAccounts
etc. shall be performed in Finacle as per the existing process on submission of applications

concemed.

I t. 11 should be ensured that in any record / document / application like AOF etc, if the

Aadhaar Number is required to be written on such document, it should be ensured that only
rnasked Aadhaar Number is rvritten, in the lorm of XXXX-XXXX--. lf any document
contains the unmasked Aadhaar, Postmaster should ensure that first eight digits of the
Aadhaar number are masked using black ink pen or sketch or by any available means.

12. Though the presence of depositor is not mandatory when the accounts are opened

through SAS agents and MPKBY agents, they may be encouraged to make the customers

presence in the post offrce at the time of opening of account, to perforn-r e-KYC due diligence.

13. All the post offices and CBS-CPCs should ensure that the Aadhaar Number is
masked in all the existing documents like AOF, KYC Form etc. containing the Aadhaar
Number including the copy of the Aadhaar obtained.

14. Circtes should ensure that paperless KYC due diligence is performed lor all the new

customers and existing account holders for ease of KYC compliance and other benefits to the

customers and Department.

15. eKYC functionality has been rolled out in l2 Head Post Offices and 2 Sub Post Oflces
in various circles on pilot basis w.e.f. 26.11 .2024. The same will be operational pan India
w.e.f.06.01.2025.

16. It is requested to circulate these instructions to all post offices for information and

guidance.

This is issued with the approval of Competent Authority

Yours laithlully

/rr
L-)

Encl: Detailed SOP 1 \
av iu(Go )

314

Assistant Director General (FS-ll )



Copy to: -

1. Sr. PPS to SecretarY (Posts)

2. PS to Director General Postal Services'

3. pps/ pS to Addl. oc tco-oraination)/Member (Banking)/I\4ember (o)/Member (P)/ Member
- 

ipf"*irg & HRD)/\4ember (PLI)/Member (Tech)/AS & FA

4. Addl. Director General, APS, New Delhi

5. Chi.f G"n"rul Manager, BD Directorate / Parcel Directorate / PLI Directorate

O. S.. l.pr,ty Director Generat (Vig & CVO) / Sr Deputy Director General (PAF)

7. Directlr, irerNp,q I GM, CEPT / Directors of all PTCs'

8. Director'General P & T (Audi|, Civil Lines' New Delhi

O. i.".",u.y, Postal Services Board/ All Deputy Directors General

iO.ett C"n"rut Managers (Finance) / Directors Postal Accounts / DDAP

ii.it. una". Secretary, MOF (DiA), NS-II Section' North Biock' New Delhi'

12.The Joint Director a goo, \ational savings Institute, ICCW Building,4 Deendayal upadhyay

Marg, New Delhi-1 10002'

13. All recognized Federations i Unions / Associations

i;. ;.pr,y iirector (oL) for information and translation of the order in Hindi language.

15. Guard File

+1\
g

a in)(Gourav
Assistant Director General (FS-ll)

414


